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% Office of Purchasing and Supply Services
PGCPS Louis Wilson, Sr. Facilities Administration Building (FAB)
13300 Old Marlboro Pike, Room 20
Upper Marlboro, MD 20772
Johnna Smarr, Acting Director Phone: 301-952-6560 Fax: 301-952-6605
NOTICE OF AWARD

Request for Renewal No. 1

July 15, 20200

Ashland Equipment Donna Parks

8660 Cherry Lane Unit #39 Phone: 301.952.6567

Laurel, MD 20707 Fax: 301.952.6605

Telephone: 301-498-2808 Email; donna.parks@pgcps.org

Contact Email: rwhite@ashlandnet.com

Subject: 1FB: 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition)

This contract is effective through April 30, 2021,

The Board of Education of Prince George’s County is exercising its option to RENEW the current contract for one (1)
year. This signed agreement is your consummation of the contract renewal. The terms and conditions set forth in the
contract award remain the same.

The intent of the contract and renewal is to provide the Board with an expedited means of procuring supplies and /or
services at the lowest cost. This contract is for the convenience of the Board and is considered by Purchasing Department
to be a “Non-Exclusive” use contract. The Board does not guarantee any usage. The Board reserves the right to purchase
any item/items listed in the price schedule submitted.

CONTRACT RENEWAL ESTIMATED AMOUNT

The estimated amount of renewal award $132,015.00

FOR THE BOARD OF EDUCATION OF PRINCE GEORGE’S COUNTY, UPPER MARLBORO, MARYLAND
20772-9983

a Acting Director of Purchasing and Supply Services

SIGNATURE TITLE

Johnna Smarr 07/15/2020

NAME DATE



Ashland Equipment Notice of Award 2
Renewal No. 1
IFB 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition)

_ 07/16/2020

SIGNATURE DATE

Mark Fossett

NAME:

Associate Superintendent for Supporting Services

TITLE

G 0711972020

SIGNATURE DATE

Barry Stanton

NAME:

Chief Operating Officer

TITLE



Ashland Equipment Notice of Award 3
Renewal No. 1
IFB 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition)

CONTRACT PRICING
DELIVERY IN
ITEM EST :;:::’:Td (I:Jg;'!'r Unit Cost Total Cost CALENDARS
. ITEM DESCRIPTTON ANNUAL | UOM (Overtime (Regular DAYS AFTER
NO OTY Model (Regular Rat Rate
Number Rate) c) ) RECEIPT OF
PURCHASE
ORDER
Delfield Model SH-3-NU
or approved equal, 3 Food .
Wells. Shelleysteel Hot l'l)?’erlal!:c:ild
1 Food Serving Counter, 50 3 EACH Model #: SH $5,380.00 No Bid $16,140.00 45 Business Days
long, 36” high, 3-food wells ool St
G B, o-100 3-NU
Without Under Storage as
specified herein.
CP-GLASS FRONT
COUNTER PROTECTOR
48.06 INCHES LONG X 18
INCHES WIDE, FIRST
TIER §/8 TOP AND Brand:
2 fll)xli?sg}{“‘“ss FRONT. 3 BaCH | Delfed 1 $146800 | Nosid $4,404.00 | 45 Business Days
INCANDESCENT LIGHT 50
ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-50
- RADIANT HEAT LAMP
ON FIRST TIER AS
SPECIFIED HEREIN
Delfield Model SH-4-NU or
approved equal, 4 Food .
Wells. Shelleysteel Hot DB‘:]a f?c;lld
3 Food Serving Counter, 60 3 EACH Model # - $5,925.00 No Bid $17,775.00 45 Business Days
long, 36" high, 4-food wells SH-4-NIj
Without Under Storage as
specified herein.
CP-GLASS FRONT
COUNTER PROTECTOR
58.06 INCHES LONG X 18
INCHES WIDE. FIRST
TIER §/S TOP AND Brand;
a (F‘II)XIEI-)GOGEJASS FRONT. 3 EACH | \ Doiele | $1.72700 | NoBid $5,181.00 | 45 Business Days
INCANDESCENT LIGHT 60
ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-60
- RADIANT HEAT LAMP
ON FIRST TIER AS
SPECIFIED HEREIN
Delfield Model SH-5-NU
or approved equal, 5 Food )
Wells. Shelleystee! Hot orand.
5 Food Serving Counter, 74" 3 EACH Model # - $6,781.00 No Bid $20,343.00 45 Business Days
long, 36" high, 5-food wells SH-S-NLi
Without Under Storage as
specified herein.




Ashland Equipment

Notice of Award
Renewal No. 1

IFB 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition)
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CP-GLASS FRONT
COUNTER PROTECTOR
72.06 INCHES LONG X 18
INCHES WIDE. FIRST
TIER $/S TOP AND
FIXED GLASS FRONT.
(1) L1-74 -
INCANDESCENT LIGHT
ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-74
- RADIANT HEAT LAMP
ON FIRST TIER AS
SPECIFIED HEREIN

EACH

Brand :
Delficld
Model #: G-
74

$2,074.00

No Bid

$6,222.00

45 Business Days

Delfield Model SCFT-50-
NU or approved equal.
SHELLEYSTEEL 50"
LONG, 36 " HIGH
MOBILE FROST TOP
SERVING COUNTER
WITHOUT
UNDERSTORAGE AS
SPECIFIED HEREIN

EACH

Brand
Delficld
Model #

SCFT-50-NU

$3,430.00

No Bid

$10,290.00

45 Business Days

CP-TWO-TIER DISPLAY.
H-50 TWO-TIER
DISPLAY 48.06 INCHES
LONG X 18 INCHES
WIDE. FIRST TIER
GLASS TOP, SECOND
TIER GLASS TOP,
ADJUSTABLE SNEESE
GUEARD FRONT, L-50
FLOURESCENT LIGHT
ON FIRST AND SECOND
TIER AS SPECIFIED
HEREIN

EACH

Brand:
Delfield
Model # : H-
50¢

$1,779.00

No Bid

$5,337.00

45 Business Days

Delfield Model SCFT-60-
NU, SHELLEYSTEEL 60"
LONG, 36 " HIGH
MOBILE FROST TOP
SERVING COUNTER
WITHOUT
UNDERSTORAGE AS
SPECIFIED HEREIN

EACH

Brand:
Delfield
Model #:
SCFT-60-NU

$4,040.00

No Bid

$12,120.00

45 Business Days

CP-TWO-TIER DISPLAY.
H-60 TWO-TIER
DISPLAY 58.06 INCHES
LONG X 18 INCHES
WIDE. FIRST TIER
GLASS TOP, SECOND
TIER GLASS TOP,
ADJUSTABLE SNEESE
GUEARD FRONT, L-60
FLOURESCENT LIGHT
ON FIRST AND SECOND
TIER AS SPECIFIED
HEREIN

EACH

Brand:
Delfield
Model # : H-
60

$2,155.00

No Bid

$6,465.00

45 Business Days

11

Delfield Model SC-28-NU
or approved equal.
SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE
ALL-PURPOSE
COUNTER, 28" L.ONG,
36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED
HEREIN

EACH

Brand:
Delfield
Model #:
SC-28-NU

$1,140.00

No Bid

£3,420.00

45 Business Days
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Renewal No. 1
IFB 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition)

Delfield Mode! SC-36-NU
or approved equal. .
SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE [)Berl“fll‘;d

12 ALL-PURPOSE EACH Model & : £1,245.00 No Bid $3,735.00 45 Business Days
COUNTER, 36" LONG, SC.36.NU
36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED
HEREIN
Delfield Model SC-50-NU.
SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE Brand:

13 égbg?ggosf]r LONG, EACH 331{;‘[";’ $1,646.00 | NoBid $4,938.00 45 Business Days
36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED SC-50-NU
HEREIN
Delfield Model SCS-30 or
approved equal. MOBLIE .
CASH COUNTER, 30" Drand:

14 LONG, 36" HIGH, EACH Model # $2,518.00 No Bid $7,554.00 45 Business Days
120V/60Hz QUTLET $CS-30
WITH 10 AMP BREAKER
AS SPECIFIED HEREIN
Delfield Model SCS-36 or
approved equal, MOBLIE .
CASH COUNTER, 36" DBESH

15 LONG, 36" HIGH, EACH Madel #: $2,6597.00 No Bid $8,091.00 45 Business Days
120V/60H2 QUTLET SCS-36.
WITH 10 AMP BREAKER
AS SPECIFIED HEREIN

Total $132,015.00




